


BID AWARD EXTENSION

BID AWARD NO.: RFB-18-17
BID ITEM: Rental of Heavy Equipment Without Operator
VENDOR / CONTRACTOR: Robert H. Finke and Sons
CURRENT EXPIRATION DATE: May 31, 2019
EXTENDED EXPIRATION DATE: May 31, 2020

VENDOR ACCEPTANCE BY:


SIGNATURE

Operations 4/18/19
TITLE DATE

COUNTY ACCEPTANCE BY:


SIGNATURE

Director, Bureau of Central Services April 4, 2019
TITLE DATE

By signing this form, both parties agree to extend the bid specifications and all conditions, including prices, for the one (1) year period as noted by the extended expiration date.



RENSSELAER COUNTY BUREAU OF CENTRAL SERVICES

STEVEN F. McLAUGHLIN
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

JAMES R. GORDON
DIRECTOR

May 15, 2018

Jared Finke, Operations
Robert H. Finke and Sons
PO Box 127
Selkirk, New York 12158

Re: RFB-18-17 Rental of Heavy Equipment Without Operator, Highway Department – NOTICE OF AWARD

Dear Mr. Finke:

I am pleased to inform you that your firm has been awarded a contract for the above-referenced bid based on your ability to meet Rensselaer County specifications and your low bid amounts for the following items:

- Item 2 – Asphalt Vibratory Roller
- Item 3 – Bulldozer DSM Caterpillar
- Item 4 – Excavator, Kobelco 140 With & Without Hydraulic Thumb
- Item 5 – Excavator, Caterpillar 330 With & Without Hydraulic Thumb
- Item 6 – Loader, John Deere 644
- Item 8 – 18" Diesel Powered Wood & Brush Chipper With & Without Winch
- Item 9 – Compact Rubber-Tracked Excavator min. 17' reach & Ditching Bucket Attachment
- Item 11 – Compact Rubber-Tracked Excavator min. 20' reach & Ditching Bucket Attachment
- Item 12 – 36" Asphalt Vibratory Roller
- Item 19 – Broom, Ride on with Cab & A/C at least 72" wide DT80
- Item 20 – Asphalt Self-Propelled Vibratory Roller 48" double steel drum, with water system HD12
- Item 22 – Excavator, steel or rubberized trac with & without hydraulic thumb
- Item 23 – Skid steer, rubberized trac 1900 lbs. with bucket 314G, with broom
- Item 24 – Pad/Sheep Foot Roller ride on 48" wide drum Hamm H5
- Item 25 – Pad/Sheep Foot Roller, ride on 84" wide drum Hamm 3410P

The estimated amount of the contract is \$34,000.00. The award period shall be from June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019. The contract may be extended, upon mutual consent of both the County and your firm, for a period of one (1) additional year, provided the vendors continue to meet specifications. The Rensselaer County Highway Department will contact your firm as equipment is needed. Thank you for submitting your bid.

Sincerely,


Christine M. Mariano
Deputy Director

cc: James R. Gordon, Director of Central Services
Lori A. Ruffinen, County Auditor
Wayne Bonesteel, County Engineer, Highway Department
Resolution: G/250/18

OFFICIAL BID FORM

Rental of Heavy Equipment WITHOUT Operator - Highway Department

Rensselaer County: Date and submission of bids up to and including 11:00 a.m. on Wednesday, March 28, 2018, at which time all bids received will be opened and read aloud.

> Enter bid rates for equipment on the appropriate line.

> Be sure that the equipment offered conforms with the technical specifications provided on pages 8 through 11. Full equipment specs are not included on the Official Bid Form.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	DAILY	WEEKLY	MONTHLY
1.	Truck mounted telescopic boom excavator			
	• XL3100	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
	• XL4100	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
2.	Asphalt Vibratory Roller	N/A	N/A	\$ 2,925.00
3.	Bulldozer D5M Caterpillar	\$ 410	\$ 1,250	\$ 3,535.00
4.	Excavator, Kobelco 140 With hydraulic thumb	350	1,000	2,939.69
	Without hydraulic thumb	300	900	2,669.69
5.	Excavator, Caterpillar 330 With hydraulic thumb	675	2,000	5,709.69
	Without hydraulic thumb	575	1,725	5,369.69
6.	Loader, John Deere 644	N/A	N/A	4,087.69
7.	Truck mounted vacuum sweeper	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8.	18" diesel powered wood and brush chipper			
	• With winch	400	1,150	3,400.00
	• Without winch	400	1,150	3,400.00
9.	Compact rubber-tracked excavator, min. 17' reach	200	525	1,550.00
	Ditching bucket attachment			
10.	Grapple truck, with lightening loader, 20 foot boom and anti- scalping trash bucket.			

OFFICIAL BID FORM

Rental of Heavy Equipment WITHOUT Operator - Highway Department

Rensselaer County: Date and submission of bids up to and including 11:00 a.m. on Wednesday, March 28, 2018, at which time all bids received will be opened and read aloud.

> Enter bid rates for equipment on the appropriate line.

> Be sure that the equipment offered conforms with the technical specifications provided on pages 8 through 11. Full equipment specs are not included on the Official Bid Form.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	DAILY	WEEKLY	MONTHLY
11.	Compact rubber-tracked excavator, min. 20' reach	200	600	1,825.00
	Ditching bucket attachment	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge
12.	36" Asphalt vibratory roller	200	450	1,350.00
13.	40' Boom Truck	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14.	55 Ton, flat bed trailer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15.	40 foot dump trailer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16.	Mechanical Sweeper	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17.	Road Widner, Self Propelled	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18.	Roadside, Flail Head Mower	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19.	Broom, Ride On With Cab & A/C at least 72" wide DT80 or Equivalent	300	625	1,850.00
20.	Asphalt self-propelled Vibratory Roller, 48" Double Steel Drum, with water system HD12 or Equivalent	200	550	1,540.00
21.	Scissor Lift, Electric Min 26ft Reach	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22.	Excavator, Steel or Rubberized Trac (18,000 lbs. 22' min reach)	275	700	1,950.00
	With hydraulic thumb	325	800	2,250.00
	Without hydraulic thumb	275	700	1,950.00

OFFICIAL BID FORM

Rental of Heavy Equipment WITHOUT Operator - Highway Department

Rensselaer County: Date and submission of bids up to and including 11:00 a.m. on Wednesday, March 28, 2018, at which time all bids received will be opened and read aloud.

> Enter bid rates for equipment on the appropriate line.

> Be sure that the equipment offered conforms with the technical specifications provided on pages 8 through 11. Full equipment specs are not included on the Official Bid Form.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	DAILY	WEEKLY	MONTHLY
23.	Skid Steer, Rubberized Trac 1900lbs with bucket 314G John Deere or Equivalent	<u>200</u>	<u>550</u>	<u>1,600.00</u>
	With broom	<u>300</u>	<u>800</u>	<u>2,300.00</u>
24.	Pad/Sheep Foot Roller, ride on 48" wide drum Hamm H 5 or Equivalent	<u>300</u>	<u>750</u>	<u>2,200.00</u>
25.	Pad/Sheep Foot Roller, ride on 84" wide drum Hamm 3410P or Equivalent	<u>400</u>	<u>1,200</u>	<u>3,000.00</u>

SURETY: No Surety is required with this bid.

PARTIAL BIDS: Partial bids will be accepted and are encouraged from contractors who do not have all of the equipment specified. Bidders may bid a single Item or any number of the Items.

LOCAL LAW #2/NON-COLLUSIVE: The 2-sided document must be signed and enclosed with the signed Official Bid Form.

Bidder Robert H. Finke and Sons Federal Tax ID # 14-1622419

Address box 127 City Selkirk State NY Zip 12158

Authorized Signature  Print Name Jared Finke

Date 3/27/18 Phone 518-767-9331 Fax 518-767-2446

Email Address jared.finke@finkeequipment.com

RETURN IN ENCLOSED ENVELOPE

LOCAL LAW #2, 1992
CERTIFICATION of COMPLIANCE

Local Law No. 2 for the Year 1992, adopted by the County of Rensselaer and effective as of September 1, 1992, provided for certain changes to the County's Code of Ethics, adopted originally in 1989. One of the changes provided for by the 1992 legislation affects those persons and entities who wish to do business with the County of Rensselaer and Hudson Valley Community College. In substance, the Code of Ethics, as amended, provides as follows:

"No elected public official or family member hereof, nor any partnership [or] unincorporated association in which he or she is a member or employee or in which he or she has a proprietary interest, nor any business or professional corporation of which he or she is an officer, director or legally or beneficially owns or controls more than five percent of the outstanding stock, shall have business dealings with Rensselaer County or any of its boards, agencies, commissions, authorities, districts and Hudson Valley Community College. For purposes of this subdivision, business dealings shall include contracts with Rensselaer County, its boards, agencies, commissions, authorities, districts and Hudson Valley Community College, gained through competitive bidding."

For the purposes of the above section, the term "family member" means "...a spouse, child, step-child, brother, sister parent, or dependent of Rensselaer County officer, employee, public official and party officers."

Should you have any questions concerning the foregoing, you should feel free to contact the Office of the Rensselaer County Attorney, located at the Ned Pattison Rensselaer County Government Center, 1600 Seventh Avenue, Troy, New York 12180, either in writing or by telephone. The telephone number for the County Attorney's office is (518) 270-2950. Their facsimile number is (518) 270-2922.

STATE OF NEW YORK

COUNTY OF RENSSELAER

The undersigned vendor/bidder hereby certifies and affirms to the County of Rensselaer, New York that it has reviewed the pertinent provisions of Local Law No. 2 of the Year 1992 for the County of Rensselaer, New York and that the undersigned vendor/bidder is not in violation of those provisions pertaining to business dealings with the County of Rensselaer.

- PRINT or TYPE ALL INFORMATION except "SIGNATURE" -

Robert H. Finke and Sons
(Name of Vendor/Company)

Jared Finke - Operations
(Person authorized to sign & Title)

box 127
(Street or Box Number)

Selkirk NY 12158
(City, State, Zip Code)


(Authorized Signature)

3/27/18
(Date)

SUBMIT THIS FORM WITH YOUR BID

CONTRACT CLAUSES REQUIRED BY LAW AND INCLUDED AS PROVISION OF THE BID

Upon the refusal of a person, when called before a Grand Jury, head of a municipality, or other Municipal Agency, which is empowered to compel the attendance of witnesses and examine them under oath, to testify in an investigation concerning any transaction or contract had with the State, any political subdivision thereof, a public authority or with any public department, agency or official of the State or any political sub-division thereof or of any public authority, to sign a waiver of immunity against subsequent criminal prosecution or to answer any relevant question concerning such transaction or contract,

- (a) such person, any firm, partnership or corporation of which he is a member, partner, director or officer shall be disqualified from thereafter selling to or submitting bids to or receiving awards from district, or any public department, agency or official thereof, for goods, work or services for a period of five years after such refusal, and to provide also that
- (b) any and all contracts made with any municipal corporation or any public department, agency or official thereof or with any fire district or any agency or official thereof by such person, and by any firm, partnership or corporation of which he is a member, partner, director or officer may be canceled or terminated by the municipal corporation or fire district without incurring any penalty or damages on account of such cancellation or termination, but any monies owing by the municipal corporation or fire district for goods delivered or work done prior to the cancellation or termination shall be paid.

Each contract to which the municipality is a party and which is of such character that the employees engaged thereon are required to be insured under the provisions of the Workmen's Compensation Law, shall contain a stipulation that such contract shall be void and of no effect unless the person or corporation making or performing such contract shall secure compensation for the benefit of, and keep insured during the life of such contract, such employees in compliance with the provision of the Workmen's Compensation Law.

A contractor, to whom any contract shall be let, granted or awarded, as required by law, shall not assign, transfer, convey, sublet or otherwise dispose of the same, or of his right, title, or interest therein, or his power to execute such contract, to any other person or corporation without the previous consent in writing of the municipality awarding the contract.

NON-COLLUSIVE BIDDING CERTIFICATION

- (a) By submission of this bid, each bidder and each person signing on behalf of any bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid each party thereto certifies as to its own organization, under penalty of perjury that to the best of knowledge and belief:
 - (1) The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently, without collusion, consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other bidder or with any competitor;
 - (2) Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in this bid have not been knowingly disclosed by the bidder and will not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to the opening directly or indirectly, to any other bidder or to any competitor; and
 - (3) No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person, partnership or Corporation to submit or not to submit a bid, for the purpose of restricting competition.

SIGNED:  DATED: 3/27/18
TITLE: Operations FIRM: Robert H. Finkle and Sons

SUBMIT THIS FORM WITH YOUR BID